	Subject: 
	Brandon Knepp

	Date: 
	Tue, 14 Jun 2022 13:35:51 +0000

	From: 
	Terry, Stephen <terrys@msu.edu>

	To: 
	Gene Klco <gmklco@att.net>



From: Brandon Knepp <knepp1bj@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, June 13, 2022 9:46 PM
To: Terry, Stephen <terrys@msu.edu>
Subject: Re: Dues Statement 
 
Thanks Terry. Unfortunately due to my the job I took a year ago I am unable to continue with the rotary. You can remove me from your mailing list. TY. 

-Brandon

On Sun, Jun 12, 2022 at 9:24 PM Terry, Stephen <terrys@msu.edu> wrote:
          Brandon Knepp
Williamston Sunrise Rotary 
                                      Dues Statement 
           April-June 2022 
 
                           
                         
Dues for the quarter                                        $     60.00  
 
Previous balance                                                    60.00 
 
Total due                                                         $   120.00                                       
 
Rotary Foundation donation                           _______            
             
Total paid                                                        $_______              
 
 
 
Checks payable to Williamston Sunrise Rotary 
 Please remit payment to Club Treasurer: 
             
                                     Stephen Terry  
                                    4015 Zimmer Rd. 
                                    Williamston, MI   48895 
 


