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This Week's Meeting
This week's meeting will be a ZOOM meeting and will feature a program by local legend James Wedgeworth. He will
give us an update on the current state of the real estate market on the island.

As you know, we are now holding hybrid meetings (see below). However, we will continue to facilitate virtual
attendance via ZOOM. You can CLICK HERE (if necessary, hold down the Control Key as you click) to join the
meeting. Contact Joe Chappell if you have any trouble.

Please note that our weekly ZOOM meetings begin at 12:00 PM (noon), not 12:30 PM.

We are continuing to employ ZOOM breakout rooms to encourage member socialization. When you join our regular
meeting, you will be sent to a breakout room -- a virtual table -- where you'll have 5-10 minutes to socialize, catch up
with and/or get to know the other people at your table.

Here's a summary of last week's meeting, provided by Linda Neff. For those of you who missed last week�s
meeting, here is the complete video of our own Amanda Williams-O'Nan sharing all the exciting changes happening
at the Heritage Academy since it was combined with the IJFA and she bought the full school. The changes in
curricula are very exciting and will produce students better equipped for lifetime careers. Click here for the link to the
video of the meeting Passcode: Vx=yX0NQ

This is also a video she tried to show, but we couldn't get the sound to work: https://youtu.be/- HUAciMRkZU

Future Weekly Meetings
Next week's meeting will be a Club Assembly and will constitute our final Club meeting of the Rotary Year. As is
traditional, President Dean will recognize those Club members and others who have made major contributions to
RCHHI's success during this challenging Rotary Year. A registration link will be provided at the June 17 meeting and
via a follow up Pmail.

Club News
Our Club continues to phase in hybrid meetings, with the live component being held at SoundWaves, located at 7
Lagoon Road. ZOOM will remain available for all other attendees. Attendance at this live meeting is limited to 40
attendees. ZOOM will remain available for all other attendees. SoundWaves will be open to registered attendees
starting at 11:30 AM, with the meeting starting at noon. Note to in-person attendees: parking is available at
SoundWaves and in the Coligny parking area across Lagoon Road. Lunches will be provided by Rock Fish at a cost
of $15, if you have registered prior to COB on Tuesday prior to the meeting and have made a lunch selection.
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Payment must be by cash, check or credit/debit card at the meeting. Lunches will NOT be billed.

Rotary Year End Party - Friday, June 18

The RCHHI Year End Party and Trivia Night is scheduled for Friday, June 18, beginning at 6:00 PM. Hopefully,
everyone has already registered to attend, either in person at SoundWaves, or via ZOOM. If you have not registered
yet and would like to attend, please contact President Dean at rdroberts29926@hargray.com STAT.

Firecracker 5K - July 4

URGENT: OUR CLUB HAS COMMITTED TO PROVIDING 20 VOLUNTEERS FOR THIS YEAR'S HHI
FIRECRACKER 5K ON JULY 4 AT JARVIS CREEK PARK. The deadline to register as a volunteer is June 21, and
we are currently far short of the needed number of volunteers. We can't afford to lose this opportunity to raise money
and provide visibility for the Club, so PLEASE register if you are able to help. We have participated in this event in
the past, and it has always been a fun way to kick off Independence Day. The registration link is: Rotary Club of
Hilton Head Island. We understand that this link may not be particularly user friendly, so if you have any problems
registering, please email President Dean or Mike Jukofsky for assistance.

Rotary National Golf Invitational
By Susan Tirard

The First and hopefully Annual, Rotary National Golf Invitational was held on Friday June 11, 2021 at the Wachesaw
East Golf Club in Murrells Inlet, South Carolina

A lovely welcome party on Thursday evening, was held at Thoroughbreds Chop House in Myrtle Beach.

Teeing off and representing the Rotary Club of Hilton Head Island:
Sandee Brooks
David Tirard
Paul Walter
David Ruckno

While this illustrious team of two right handers and two lefties, did not take home the prize, a great time was had by
all! They were the only team with matching golf gear including plaid sunglasses from The Heritage. Hilton Head
Rotary Club Pride.

All monies raised are going to support End Polio Now and The Cart Fund for Alzheimer Research.

Thank you to our club for participating with a Hole Sponsorship.

Hopefully many more teams will participate next year and join in the fun and fellowship!
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Volunteer Request for Juneteenth at Mitchelville - Saturday, June 19

As President Dean recently requested, the Mitchelville Preservation Project has asked if our Club might be able to
provide a half dozen or so volunteers to drive golf carts to accommodate general transportation needs for the
Juneteenth Celebration at the Park on Saturday, June 19 -- nominally between 10:00am and 3:00pm (perhaps in two
shifts). Please let President Dean know if you are interested in helping and he will coordinate the effort with
Mitchelville. This is rapidly developing into an important annual event on the Island and it provides us with a golden
opportunity for visibility that can help build Club diversity.

ZOOM Etiquette

As we continue to meet via ZOOM, please remember it's possible for our speaker, as well as other Club members, to
see a member's Chat entries. This has the potential to be embarrassing, not only for the members involved, but also
for our Club. Please refrain from using the Chat feature for non-program related questions or comments. But please
do use the Chat feature for your questions or comments related to the program!

Happy Dollars

Club members can make actual (as opposed to virtual) Happy Dollar donations to CART via www.mycartfund.org.
Virtual Happy Dollars have been a great feature of our weekly ZOOM meetings, but haven't necessarily translated
into cash contributions. The Cart Fund Portal is a channel that can facilitate converting virtual Happy Dollars into
actual donations by establishing a virtual CART Bucket. Club members can announce their Happy Dollars during the
ZOOM meeting and then donate actual Happy Dollars via the Portal. Please contact President Dean if you have any
questions or experience any problems completing your donation.

No time to announce your good news Happy Dollars during our Zoom meeting? No problem! Send your Happy
Dollar news to Soundings Editor Bob Eberly prinzarnulf@hargray.com. We'll print them in the next edition of the
Soundings.

Do you have a Happy Dollars moment or event to share?

Invite Your Friends to Attend!

As always, Club members should feel free to invite friends or visiting Rotarians to attend our weekly ZOOM
meetings. You may certainly invite a prospective member to one of our meetings as well. It's an easy way to
introduce someone to Rotary, and since all of our members' names are listed by their ZOOM squares, a potential
member can see at a glance who else belongs to the Club. Remember to provide President Dean or Sergeant-at-
Arms Michael Murphy information regarding potential visitors and guests so that they may be recognized at the
meeting.

This Day in History

June 17, 1885--The French gift to the United States, "The Statue of Liberty," arrives in New York harbor aboard the
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French ship Isere.

And a bonus entry this week, just because it led to the only time a President went before the American people and
told them that "I am not a crook!"

June 17, 1972--Five men are arrested for breaking into the offices of the Democratic National Committee at The
Watergate in Washington, D.C.

The Four-Way Test

Of the things we think, say or do
1. Is it the TRUTH?

2. Is it FAIR to all concerned?

3. Will it build GOODWILL and BETTER FRIENDSHIPS?

4. Will it be BENEFICIAL to all concerned?






